
 
 

 
 

 

 

HERITAGE PLAQUE PROGRAM 
 
 
 

ABOUT THE PROGRAM 

The City of Salmon Arm’s Community 
Heritage Commission (CHC) has launched a 
new program. The initiative recognizes owners 
of commercial, institutional, or residential 
structures with known historical or cultural 
significance. 

The CHC has commissioned small bronze 
plaques. The tasteful commemorative signage 
is oval, measures 8.5 x 5.25 inches, and is 
designed to be installed on the exterior of 
heritage buildings. 

INSTALLATION CRITERIA 
 

We ask that you comply with the following 
criteria when installing your plaque: 

▪ Installed on the façade of the building 

▪ Installed at a height roughly at eye level 

▪ Installed in a location that is visible from a 
public street 

THANK YOU AND PHOTOS 

We are happy to present you with this plaque 
in recognition of your building’s historical 
merit. 

We appreciate your significant commitment 
and effort to preserve built heritage. 

Please send a photo of the plaque once it is 
installed (with or without you in the photo) 
using the contact information below. 

If you are interested in being a part of 
promotional material for this new program and 
sharing the history of your building, please 
contact us! 

QUESTIONS 

If you have any questions, please contact 
Morgan Paiement or visit City Hall between 
the hours of 8:30 am to 4:00 p.m., Monday to 
Friday: 

City of Salmon Arm 
500 - 2 Avenue NE 
Box 40 
Salmon Arm, BC, V1E 4N2 

Telephone: 250-803-4021 
Facsimile: 250-803-4041 
Email:  mpaiement@salmonarm.ca 

Check out the City of Salmon Arm Heritage 
Webpage:  www.salmonarm.ca/463/heritage 
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